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[bookmark: _MailOriginal]From: rlibrary@bresnan.net <rlibrary@bresnan.net> 
Sent: Friday, January 5, 2024 4:32 PM
To: 'scottcain scottcain' <scottcain@pga.com>; Heidi He Does it <heidi@hkadamslaw.com>; Kirt Nell <knell@bresnan.net>; Colleen Harrington <colleenharrington@comcast.net>; 'Amy Sweet' <amylarasweet@gmail.com>
Subject: January 2024 Invoices for approval

Hello Trustees,

Happy 2024 to all of you! I have attached a pdf featuring the invoices needing approval in January. I don’t anticipate any questions, but I will comment, as always, on the G&J Elevator invoice. This is a required annual testing, and this is a year where everything was functional. We only required one visit and we were able to share the mileage and drive time with another Red Lodge business. Yes, this is one of those examples where $750.00 is the cost in a “cheap” year!

Please chime in if you have any additional questions. Otherwise, I would ask the first trustee who replies (if in favor of paying the bills) to make a motion that the invoices be paid. The second to reply can second that motion, and then the remainder can reply with a yay or nay to approve the invoices for payment. These emails will become part of our minutes as official record that the board reviewed the invoices and approved of their payment. 

~ Jodie

Jodie Moore, Library Director
Red Lodge Carnegie Library
3 W 8th St / PO Box 1068
Red Lodge, MT 59068
(406-446-1905)

From: Heidi He Does It <heidi@hkadamslaw.com> 
Sent: Friday, January 5, 2024 6:01 PM
Subject: Re: January 2024 Invoices for approval

I move to pay the bills!
Heidi
Sent from my iPhone

From: scottcain scottcain <scottcain@pga.com> 
Sent: Friday, January 5, 2024 6:30 PM
Subject: Re: January 2024 Invoices for approval

I approve to “pay the bills.”

Scott Cain
PGA Master Professional
406 N. Haggin Ave 437

-----Original Message-----
From: Kirt Nell <kirtnell@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, January 5, 2024 8:30 PM
Subject: Re: January 2024 Invoices for approval

I vote to pay the bills.

Kirt


From: Amy Sweet <amylarasweet@gmail.com> 
Sent: Saturday, January 6, 2024 7:16 AM
Subject: Re: January 2024 Invoices for approval

I vote yes.

Amy




